
1 

This is an accepted manuscript of the following: 
Johnsen, K. I., Benjaminsen, T. A., & Eira, I. M. G. (2015). Seeing like the state or like 
pastoralists? Conflicting narratives on the governance of Sámi reindeer husbandry in 
Finnmark, Norway. Norsk Geografisk Tidsskrift - Norwegian Journal of Geography, 69(4), 
230-241. doi:10.1080/00291951.2015.1033747 
 
 
 
Seeing like the state or like pastoralists? Conflicting narratives on the 
governance of Sámi reindeer husbandry in Finnmark, Norway 
 

Kathrine Ivsett Johnsen, Tor A. Benjaminsen & Inger Marie Gaup Eira 

Johnsen, K.I., Benjaminsen, T.A. & Eira, I.M.G. 2015. Seeing like the state or like 
pastoralists? Conflicting narratives on the governance of Sámi reindeer husbandry in 
Finnmark, Norway. Norsk Geografisk Tidsskrift–Norwegian Journal of Geography Vol. 00, 
00–00. ISSN 0029-1951. 
 

The article examines key actors’ perceptions on why Norwegian policy objectives aimed at 
securing sustainable reindeer husbandry through participation have failed in West Finnmark. 
Based on government documents, media debates, and interviews with the actors, the authors 
identify two competing narratives on why there are ‘too many reindeer’ despite continued 
state efforts at destocking. The dominant narrative claims that participation is unsuccessful 
because herders do not accept expert advice, but increase their herds for personal gain. The 
Sámi pastoralists’ counter-narrative claims that lack of transparency hinders participation and 
policy implementation. Inspired by political ecology and perspectives on governance within 
development studies, the authors examine why the government’s narrative dominates public 
debates, while the counter-narrative remains marginalized. They find that the dominant 
narrative frames destocking as an apolitical and objective measure based on unequivocal 
scientific advice, while the pastoralists’ rejection of such advice is presented as ignorant and 
irrational. The dominant narrative’s authority is further increased by numerous press reports 
(repeated in social media) of overstocking threatening biodiversity and economic 
development. The authors conclude that due to the persistence of the dominant narrative, it 
has become an undisputed truth in Norwegian debates that Sámi pastoralists are overstocking 
to maximize their benefits. 
 

Keywords: governance, narratives, reindeer husbandry, Sámi 

Kathrine Ivsett Johnsen, Department of International Environment and Development Studies 
(Noragric), Norwegian University of Life Sciences, PO Box 5003, NO-1432 Ås, Norway. E-
mail: katjohns@nmbu.no; Tor A. Benjaminsen, Department of International Environment and 
Development Studies (Noragric), Norwegian University of Life Sciences, PO Box 5003, NO-
1432 Ås, Norway. E-mail: t.a.benjaminsen@nmbu.no; Inger Marie Gaup Eira, Sámi 
University College, Hannoluohkka 45, NO-9520 Kautokeino, Norway, and International 
Centre for Reindeer Husbandry, Bredbuktnesveien 50B, NO-9520 Kautokeino, Norway. E-
mail: ingermge@gmail.com   



 

2 
 

Introduction 

Sámi resistance to the construction of a high dam in the Alta-Kautokeino River (Alta-

Kautokeinovassdraget) in the late 1970s and early 1980s increased national awareness of the 

rights of the Norwegian Sámi. Even though the struggle over the dam was lost, it led to some 

compensatory initiatives from the state, such as the institutionalization of indigenous peoples’ 

rights in government and law. In 1987 the Sámi Act was introduced, and in 1988 the ‘Sámi 

Paragraph’ (§110a) was incorporated into the Norwegian Constitution as a measure to redress 

past injustices (Skogvang 2013). One year later the Sámi Parliament (Sámediggi) was 

established, and in 1990 Norway was the first country to ratify the International Labour 

Organization’s convention on indigenous peoples’ rights to preserve and develop their own 

culture, ILO Convention No. 169.  

Today, some 30 years after the Alta dispute, there is a common assumption in Norway 

that the historical injustices against the Sámi have been rectified and that the Sámi enjoy 

extensive rights in the management of land and natural resources. Some have argued that the 

rights allocated are too extensive and that they are at the expense of majority needs and 

interests (e.g. ABC Nyheter 2009; Fremskrittspartiet 2014). Meanwhile, the Sámi Parliament 

holds that state authorities constantly contest Sámi ownership and use of traditional land and 

resources, and challenge the Sámi’s opportunity to exercise control over their own economic, 

cultural, and social development (Sámediggi n.d.). This controversy over the Sámi people’s 

ability to participate in the management of land and resources is especially apparent in the 

case of reindeer pastoralism, as state authorities and reindeer herders have contrasting 

perspectives on the current management regime. 

Government officials and national politicians have for many years been concerned that 

a growing number of semi-domesticated reindeer in Finnmark is leading to the overstocking 

and degradation of pastures and increased rates of animal diseases, starvation, and loss of 
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reindeer to predators. While herders to a certain extent agree that there are currently too many 

reindeer some places in Finnmark, they do not concur with the authorities’ explanations for 

why the reindeer numbers are increasing or on the general consequences of the high numbers. 

Paine (1996, 130) shows that herders have a contextualized view on the concept of ‘too many 

reindeer’, and explains that an owner losing animals to others may recognize that he has ‘too 

many’ to handle and seek help with the herding; though, when the herders’ children are old 

enough to help out, the same number of reindeer might be considered ‘too few’. Paine (1996) 

further explains that in another context, too many reindeer could mean too little pasture at 

certain seasons.  

Further, herders and government officials have diverging perspectives on the 

pastoralists’ possibilities to engage in political decision-making related to solving the problem 

of too many reindeer. There is a dominant policy narrative claiming that herders hold a 

considerable amount of decision-making power, and a counter-narrative among the 

pastoralists arguing that the state neglects the herders’ rights to participate in decision-making 

relevant to their livelihoods. While the views among state officials and politicians are often 

reflected in media and online discussions, the pastoralists’ counter-narrative is rarely 

represented in public debates. This latter point triggered us to study the diverging perspectives 

and their differing appeal to the general public. In line with Forsyth (2008), we believe actors’ 

explanations of phenomena reflect the interests and values of those who formulated these 

explanations. Forsyth (2008) explains that the perspectives of the more powerful groups in 

society are more likely to become the conventional explanations, the dominant narratives. 

Hence, facts and knowledge are situated, partial, and struggled over.  

Based on narrative analyses in political ecology (e.g. Adger et al. 2001; Benjaminsen 

& Svarstad 2008; Benjaminsen et al. 2009; Vik et al. 2010) and inspired by theoretical 

contributions within development studies on ‘governance’ (e.g. Scott 1998; Li 2007), we 
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explore the interests, values, and power in the governance of reindeer pastoralism imbued in 

the conflicting narratives. We start by exploring the state officials’ and herders’ perspectives 

on participation in reindeer management. Then we identify four themes embedded in the 

narratives – participation, knowledge, Sámi rights, and actor rationality – and discuss the 

contrasting interpretations and power struggles that the two narratives involve through a focus 

on these themes. Thereafter, we critically assess the dominant accounts of reindeer 

governance and why the pastoralists’ counter-narrative remains largely unknown or ignored 

in Norwegian public debates. 

We define governance as patterns of rule, which include politics and power relations. 

In line with Bridge & Perreault (2009), who discuss environmental governance, we 

understand the governance of reindeer husbandry as both the social organization of decision-

making related to reindeer and the production of social order through the administration of 

reindeer herding and husbandry. In this article, we use the term ‘herder’ to refer to both 

reindeer owners and individuals who carry out practical work with reindeer, and we use 

‘herder’ and ‘pastoralist’ interchangeably.  

Our approach to issues concerning the governance of reindeer husbandry is based on 

previous research on circumpolar reindeer husbandry, pastoral systems in Africa, and lived 

experience (as one of the authors is from a reindeer herding family). Guided by political 

ecology, we subscribe to both environmental sustainability and social justice as core values.  

Our study is based on qualitative interviews conducted during the period 2012–2014 

with 32 individuals, of which 10 were Sámi reindeer herders from West Finnmark; the 

remaining interviewees were undertaken with regional and national government officials (20) 

and politicians (1 in the Norwegian Parliament (Storting) and 1 in the Sámi Parliament), 

Those interviewed included staff at the Office of the Auditor General (Riksrevisjonen) and 

former and current leaders of the Sámi Reindeer Herders Association of Norway (Norske 
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Reindriftssamers Landsforbund, NRL). The interviews, which were conducted in Norwegian, 

recorded, and transcribed. They provided information on the actors’ experiences and 

perspectives on reindeer management generally and more specifically on the recent decision-

making process for setting the upper limits for reindeer numbers (i.e. the carrying capacity of 

the summer pastures in West Finnmark). In order to understand the background to the current 

situation, we read historical records on reindeer husbandry, government reports, 

correspondence between the actors, transcripts of discussions in the Norwegian Parliament 

and Sámi Parliament, and followed debates in the media. In this article, all quotes from 

Norwegian sources have been translated by us. In order to preserve the informants’ 

anonymity, we refer to them by number (e.g. #3 refers to informant 3 or informants group 3). 

 

 

Reindeer policies and governance 

In Norway, c.250,000 semi-domesticated reindeer are currently herded on land covering 

c.40% of the mainland area of the country (Reindriftsforvaltningen 2013). Only people of 

Sámi ethnicity may own reindeer in Norway, with the exception of a few concession areas in 

southern parts of the country (Vistnes et al. 2009). All reindeer herding is regulated by the 

Reindeer Herding Act (Lov om reindrift) passed in 2007. Approximately 73% of all reindeer 

are found in Finnmark, the northernmost county of Norway. Nearly all of Finnmark is part of 

the reindeer herding area; the interior south is used as winter pastures, while the increasingly 

developed coastal area is used as spring, summer, and autumn pastures. Most herds cross a 

number of municipalities on their way between the winter and summer grazing areas.  

The state-led rationalization of Sámi reindeer husbandry was intensified from the late 

1970s onwards with both the introduction of public investments to maximize meat production 

and herders’ income (Paine 1994) and the formal organization of the herding district boards. 
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The governance of reindeer pastoralism in Norway is divided into 77 different herding 

districts, which are administrative and geographical units covering the seasonal pastures of 

one or several herding groups. However, in the interior of Finnmark the winter, spring, and 

autumn pastures are defined by the state as communal pastures shared among more than 100 

herding groups despite the fact that individual customary herding institutions (siida) have 

traditionally controlled these pastures, albeit with some flexibility in time and space (Sara 

2009; Mikkel Nils Sara, personal communication 28 February 2014). From the 1960s 

onwards, motorized vehicles (snowmobiles and all-terrain vehicles) made herding more 

efficient and thus possible to increase the size of the herds (Riseth 2013).  

However, since the late 1980s, there has been growing concern that high numbers of 

reindeer would lead to overgrazing, land-use conflicts, and inefficient meat production, 

especially in Finnmark. Ecological, economic, and cultural sustainability became the main 

objectives of the Norwegian reindeer husbandry policy of 1992 (St.meld nr. 28 (1991–1992)). 

Under the policy, new laws, regulations, and economic incentives were implemented to 

motivate herders to restructure and reduce the size of their herds, but the implementation of 

the policy had little success in Finnmark. The general trend was that the reindeer numbers 

continued to increase, their slaughter rate remained low, and reindeer meat productivity 

declined (Reindriftsforvaltningen 2014).  

In 2007, a new Reindeer Husbandry Act was adopted. The Act was designed to 

improve the efficiency of the management regime and to develop sustainable reindeer 

husbandry through internal self-management and increased participation 

(Reindriftsforvaltningen 2009). A new tool for planning at community level was introduced: 

rules governing seasonal pasture use, migratory routes, and reindeer numbers. The purpose of 

these policy measures was to let the herding district boards develop their own management 

plans by integrating the traditional use of pastures with public legislation 
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(Reindriftsforvaltningen 2009). A working group consisting of two biologists, two 

government officials, and six herders was commissioned to identify indicators for calculating 

ecologically sustainable reindeer numbers. The indicators were presented as guidelines that 

included scientific knowledge as well as herders’ experience-based and traditional knowledge 

of reindeer and pasture ecology (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 2008b). In the cases where 

herding districts had more reindeer than was considered as ecologically sustainable, the 

districts were requested to develop reduction plans. The process of establishing maximum 

reindeer numbers formed the basis of the analysis presented in this article. 

With the guidelines in place, a deadline of July 2009 was set for the summer pasture 

districts to submit management plans. The procedure was as follows: the districts would 

develop internal plans, the plans would then be endorsed by the area boards (områdestyrene), 

and thereafter the central Reindeer Husbandry Board (Reindriftsstyret) would give final 

approval for reindeer numbers for each district (Reindriftsforvaltningen 2009). In cases where 

the Reindeer Husbandry Board rejected the plans, the districts could revise and resubmit a 

proposal. If the Board rejected their proposal a second time, the district could file a complaint 

to the Ministry of Food and Agriculture (Landbruks- og matdepartementet, LMD). From the 

beginning of 2014, the national and regional management of reindeer husbandry has been 

vested respectively in the LMD and the five northernmost County Governor’s Offices.1  

The Reindeer Husbandry Board is a decision-making and advisory body that was 

established under the Reindeer Husbandry Act of 1978 (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 

2013). While NRL has the right to propose board members, they are appointed by the Sámi 

Parliament (three members) and the LMD (four members) (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 

2009). From 1978 to 2013, the management regime included six area boards, one for each 

reindeer pasture region in Norway. Again, NRL had the right to propose members, who were 

appointed by the Sámi Parliament and the County Councils (Fylkesting). The area boards had 
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the authority to object to development plans that would affect reindeer grazing and migration 

areas. However, amendments to the Reindeer Husbandry Act terminated the area boards at the 

end of 2013, and the boards’ mandate was transferred to the respective County Governors 

(Fylkesmennene) in the five northernmost counties. NRL and the Sámi Parliament have 

expressed concerns that the organizational changes make it more difficult for herders to 

influence decision-making affecting their livelihoods because the County Governor’s Office 

is not a politically representative body.  

The process of securing sustainable reindeer husbandry in Finnmark, especially in 

West Finnmark, has been a policy objective since 1992 (St.meld nr. 28 (1991–1992)). On two 

occasions, in 2004 and 2012, the Office of the Auditor General has evaluated the LMD’s 

ability to implement sustainable reindeer husbandry in Finnmark (Riksrevisjonen 2004; 

2012). Both reports criticized the LMD’s lack of results in terms of reducing reindeer 

numbers. Holding the LMD accountable, the Norwegian Parliament has repeatedly 

emphasized the urgent need to secure sustainable reindeer husbandry in the north. There have 

been several public debates about the possibilities for forced slaughter of reindeer in 

Finnmark (e.g. NTB 1999b; Nordlys 2005; Aftenposten 2011a; 2011b). In January 2013, the 

LMD instructed the Reindeer Husbandry Board to make herd reduction plans for those 

herding districts that had not developed their own reduction plans. A divided board followed 

by making reduction plans for almost all summer pasture districts in West Finnmark and 

some of the districts in East Finnmark (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 2014b). In West 

Finnmark, 16 districts and herding groups were requested to reduce their reindeer numbers by 

between 6.5% and 62.4%, an average of c.30% over the period 2012–2015 

(Reindriftsforvaltningen 2012; 2013).  
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Actors’ perspectives on deciding reindeer numbers 

Based on transcripts of interviews and other written material, we identified the key actors’ 

differing claims about the decision-making process of setting maximum reindeer numbers for 

the herding groups in West Finnmark. The interviewed government officials described the 

reindeer husbandry policy as being in line with international indigenous peoples’ rights 

(government officials #10, group interview September 2012) and claimed that the policy 

secures a bottom-up approach to reindeer management (government officials #9, group 

interview August 2012) (for the rational behind the 2007 Act, see Landbruks- og 

matdepartementet & Reindriftsforvaltningen 2007). Lars Peder Brekk, Minister of Agriculture 

and Food in the period 2008–2012, argued that the 2007 Act is based on the herders’ 

perspectives and gives herders an increased opportunity for participation in decision-making 

and increased responsibility for reindeer management (Brekk 2011). The interviewed 

government officials argued that reindeer herders formed the majority of members of the 

committee that drafted the 2007 Act, as well as in the working group that developed 

indicators for estimating sustainable reindeer numbers (government officials #10, group 

interview September 2012). According to the same government officials, no other regulations 

in Norway secure the same level of stakeholder participation in decision-making as the 

Reindeer Husbandry Act.  

One government official (#7, interview August 2012) emphasized that the estimates of 

carrying capacity were not based on layman’s knowledge but on ‘thorough and proper 

research’ by experts on reindeer and pastures. While admitting that the political objective of 

sustainable reindeer husbandry from 1992 had not been met, the interviewed government 

officials did not question the appropriateness of the strategy and regulations. One government 

official (#8, interview August 2012) argued that abandoning the strategy would mean 

discarding 12–15 years of work and would jeopardize any opportunity to improve the reindeer 
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industry. He claimed that there were no alternative ways of achieving the political objective, 

only alternatives for worsening the situation.  

In accordance with the 2007 Act, the herding districts were given a deadline to 

identify maximum reindeer numbers, and if needed, to develop herd reduction plans within 

the herding districts (Reindriftsforvaltningen 2009). However, as many herding district boards 

in Finnmark were not able to develop management plans, the authorities had to develop the 

plans for them (government officials #10, group interview September 2012). Trygve 

Slagsvold Vedum, Minister of Agriculture and Food in the period 2012–2013, informed that 

although large herds of reindeer are considered prestigious within the herding community, the 

herders should rather think in terms of economy and ecology in order to save the reindeer 

industry (Aftenposten 2012).  

The interviewed herders said that although herders had participated in the 

development of the 2007 Act and the indicators for estimating sustainable reindeer numbers, 

they still experienced that their input and concerns were not recognized in the practical 

management of reindeer husbandry. Initially, they had confidence in the decision-making 

processes, and according to one herder almost all herding groups in West Finnmark started to 

work on establishing sustainable reindeer numbers and developing reduction plans: ‘we even 

started slaughtering more than we had ever done before’ (reindeer herder #4, interview June 

2013). Another herder claimed that when they had finalized their herd-reduction plans, the 

authorities suddenly introduced new indicators that were not compatible with the plans they 

had developed (reindeer herder #3, interview June 2013). The interviewed herders explained 

that the LMD dismissed the herders’ plans and required the Reindeer Husbandry Board to 

define maximum reindeer numbers based on the new indicators. One herder said: ‘The LMD 

claims we did not make reduction plans but that is a lie!’ (reindeer herder #4, interview June 

2013). Several herders (e.g. reindeer herder #9, interview June 2013) argued that although 
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Norway has signed international conventions on indigenous peoples’ rights, the LMD did not 

apply them in its decision-making. The herders claimed that the LMD’s decisions were rather 

driven by the national goal to increase industrial development in Finnmark and referred to the 

state’s costly investment in mapping mineral resources in northern Norway. One herder 

(herder #6, interview June 2013) said that the state regarded reindeer husbandry as a 

negligible industry and a bottleneck for ‘real’ resource extraction, while another herder 

(herder #8, interview August 2013) claimed that it was not by chance that the state’s pressure 

to reduce reindeer numbers had increased after the launch of the Government’s Strategy for 

the High North (Regjeringens nordområdestrategi).2 

Clearly, the actors have very different ways of interpreting the decision-making 

process related to establishing a ceiling on reindeer numbers for herding groups in West 

Finnmark, and they emphasized different aspects of the process. While the government 

officials focused on herders’ formal possibilities for involvement in the development of the 

policy and regulation, the herders focused on the lack of involvement in and ownership of the 

decisions when the regulations were implemented. Further, while the government officials 

emphasized the inclusion of herders’ knowledge in the crafting of the herding district 

management plans, herders emphasized that their knowledge was not recognized in the final 

decisions on reindeer numbers. The actors had different views on whether the indigenous 

peoples’ rights were applied in decision-making, and the two groups of actors presented each 

other as a threat to the sustainability of reindeer husbandry. 

The opposing claims on the governance of reindeer husbandry can be presented as two 

short narratives. We define narratives as stories with a beginning, middle, and end, or when 

cast in the form of an argument, with premises and conclusions (Roe 1991). Hence, narratives 

are social constructions about specific cases formed as stories. We follow Vik et al. (2010, 

37), who ‘understand narratives to be the underlying patterns in the stories told by 
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individuals’. Based on grounded theory3 with an open coding of the interviews carried out, we 

have identified a dominant narrative expressed by most government officials and by 

politicians, the media, and many scientists in Norway, and a counter-narrative articulating the 

views of many reindeer herders, especially in West Finnmark. 

The dominant narrative argues that despite participatory decision-making, the 

governance of reindeer husbandry has failed in the northernmost parts of Norway because 

herders would not act in a rational way and accept available scientific ecological knowledge 

as a basis for dealing with the problem of too many reindeer. Consequently, the state had to 

intervene to ensure sustainable reindeer husbandry for the benefit of the next generation of 

Sámi herders. The counter-narrative claims that the LMD’s talk about participation and 

indigenous peoples’ rights in the governance of reindeer husbandry is only lip service because 

the authorities do not recognize either the herders’ knowledge or their rights. The ultimate 

result of this policy would be to free the land of reindeer for the benefit of industrial 

development. As a consequence, the herders have never had a real opportunity to participate 

in the decision-making on reindeer numbers.  

 

 

Four shared themes 

On the basis of our interviews and written documents, we have identified four shared themes 

that the actors stressed when discussing why the agreed process of decision-making on 

reindeer numbers in West Finnmark was not successful: the participation of reindeer herders 

in reindeer management; herders’ knowledge relevant to the governance of reindeer 

husbandry; Sámi rights; and actor rationality. We explore these four themes by assessing the 

interpretations and opinions expressed through the informants’ statements on the governance 

of reindeer husbandry. We also discuss examples of diverging views within the actor groups. 
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Participation 

The actors presented strongly differing stories describing the herders’ participation in the 

management of reindeer husbandry. Interviewed government officials argued that the lack of 

results raised the question as to whether herders in Finnmark had the capacity to participate in 

the decision-making processes related to herd reduction (government officials #10, group 

interview September 2012). They argued that herders dominated the working group that 

developed the premise for ecological sustainable numbers. According to the interviewed 

government officials, the politicians and bureaucrats were sceptical towards giving herders 

full responsibility for establishing maximum reindeer numbers, and therefore the Reindeer 

Husbandry Act of 2007 gave the authority to the Reindeer Husbandry Board to evaluate 

whether the herders’ proposals for herd size were sustainable and make final decisions on 

reindeer numbers. The Act also increased the state’s possibility for sanctioning herding 

districts and individual herders that did not comply with the regulations (government officials 

#9, group interview August 2012). Hence, in the cases where the herding districts could not 

demonstrate that their proposed reindeer numbers would be sustainable and in accordance 

with the sustainability indicators, the authorities set the carrying capacity and made herd 

reduction plans for those districts (government officials #9, group interview August 2012). 

The Norwegian Parliament gave further legitimacy to the LMD’s actions by, on 

several occasions, criticizing the Ministry for not achieving the political goal of reducing the 

reindeer population in Finnmark to a sustainable level. There was a strong view among some 

politicians that the state should use a much tougher approach in order to cut reindeer numbers. 

They found support in the findings of a research project at the University of Tromsø called 

Ecosystem Finnmark (Økosystem Finnmark) that co-management and participative 
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management did not work in the reindeer industry. The project’s leader, Professor Rolf A. 

Ims, stated: ‘the project has also debunked a few myths, such as the theory that participation, 

voluntary agreements and economic incentives, so-called “carrot” methods, are more efficient 

than the good old stick’ (forskning.no 2010). 

Trygve Slagsvold Vedum (former Minister of Food and Agriculture), assured the 

Norwegian Parliament, in a debate in January 2013, that the LMD had shown commitment to 

reducing the number of reindeer in Finnmark through its strong and direct involvement in the 

decision-making process (Stortinget 2013). Staff at the Office of the Auditor General 

commended the LMD for altering the indicators and instructing the Reindeer Husbandry 

Board to make decisions on maximum reindeer numbers (government officials #6, group 

interview August 2012). They argued that the LMD’s intervention was a necessary step in 

reducing the reindeer numbers.  

While government officials stated that the herders had not been capable or able to use 

the tools allocated to engage in decision-making, the interviewed herders argued that in reality 

herders did not have the possibility to participate in the decision-making because the 

authorities did not recognize their input to the process. Late in 2010 the Reindeer Husbandry 

Board started reviewing proposed reindeer numbers from districts in West Finnmark. The 

proposals were discussed in meetings between representatives of the herding districts and the 

Norwegian Reindeer Husbandry Administration (Statens reindriftsforvaltning), and the 

districts were advised to lower further their proposed reindeer numbers, which they did 

(government official #3, interview August 2013). The Reindeer Husbandry Administration 

was aware that the revised reindeer numbers were not as low as they should have been 

according to the indicators, but the thinking was that it was important to reach consensus with 

the herders, secure their feeling of ownership to the decision, and start implementing the 

reduction plans (government official #5, interview January 2014). The first six proposals from 
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districts in West Finnmark were approved by the Reindeer Husbandry Board, but the LMD 

reversed the approvals, arguing that the decisions on maximum numbers were not sustainable 

and instructing the Board on how to interpret the indicators for ecologically sustainable 

reindeer numbers (letter from the LMD to the Board, dated 28 January 2011).4 The LMD 

requested that the Board should work together with the districts in setting lower reindeer 

numbers, but herders were reluctant to re-engage in the process. During 2011 the Reindeer 

Husbandry Board set maximum reindeer numbers on behalf of all but one summer herding 

district in West Finnmark. 

In a letter to the LMD, the Sámi Reindeer Herders Association of Norway (NRL) 

explained that the herders’ dissatisfaction with the decision-making process was primarily 

related to the fact that their assessments had been dismissed without explanation (letter dated 

6 December 2011; for source, see note 4). NRL argued that the Reindeer Husbandry Board’s 

decisions on maximum reindeer numbers were not in accordance with the agreed decision-

making processes, the Reindeer Husbandry Act, or the European Convention on Human 

Rights. Many of the herding districts in Finnmark appointed lawyers that assisted them in 

objecting to both the decision-making process and the final decisions on reindeer numbers. 

One of the lawyers argued in a letter to the Reindeer Husbandry Administration that the 

LMD’s instructions to the Reindeer Husbandry Board had turned the process into top-down 

decision-making, which had deprived both the herders and the Board of their rights to do 

make their own assessments of the need for reductions in herd sizes.5 The lawyer claimed that 

the state’s reduction plans were not in accordance with Norwegian or international law and 

consequently the herding districts would not accept the plans. 

One of the herders (herder #8, interview August 2013), who was a member of the 

working group that had developed the first set of indicators for calculating ecologically 

sustainable reindeer numbers, said that there was a common understanding in the working 
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group that the indicators were to be seen as guidelines. He argued that since 2009 the 

authorities had not only altered the indicators, but also started to interpret them as 

instructions. According to many of the interviewed herders, the authorities had laid down new 

premises for the decision-making process, and therefore the only way for them to participate 

in the process was by accepting those premises. One of the district leaders used a metaphor to 

describe the herders’ possibility to participate in the decision-making: ‘Imagine that you are 

in a house. You are told that you are free to leave anytime you wish, but all of the doors and 

windows have been sealed, so you have nowhere to exit’ (herder #9, interview June 2013).  

The primary purpose of the indicators for calculating ecologically sustainable reindeer 

numbers was to develop a decision-making tool that could address the authorities’ concern 

about the overstocking of reindeer in Finnmark. Allowing the herder representatives to form 

the majority in the working group can be seen as a measure to gain legitimacy among the 

reindeer herders on the follow-up use of the indicators. However, as Agrawal & Gibson 

(1999) have shown, communities are not necessarily homogenous groups. In the case of the 

working group, the reindeer herders did not represent one uniform interest or knowledge 

system. Rather, NRL had appointed herders from different parts of the reindeer husbandry 

area in Norway to ensure that various concerns were represented in the working group. The 

representatives from Finnmark were a minority in the working group, despite the fact that 

challenge of ‘too many reindeer’ was regarded as primarily a Finnmark problem. By contrast, 

Sámi herders in the south of Norway have implemented the LMD’s model for sustainable 

reindeer husbandry to a greater extent.  

 

 

Knowledge 
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Both government officials and herders recognized the importance of including experience-

based knowledge in the management of reindeer husbandry, but the two groups had different 

interpretations of the degree to which the governance of reindeer husbandry reflected herders’ 

knowledge. The interviewed government officials claimed that the current management 

regime for reindeer husbandry is based on traditional knowledge and organization as the 

herders were represented in developing the Reindeer Husbandry Act and in identifying 

indicators for ecologically sustainable reindeer management. However, interviewed herders 

argued that in practice traditional knowledge was downplayed. They emphasized the lack of 

Sámi traditional knowledge in the implementation of the law and in practical decision-making 

on reindeer numbers and reduction plans. 

The government officials based their arguments for decision-making on mathematical 

models for estimating the carrying capacity of grazing land. A regression model developed by 

Lenvik (1990) on the relationship between reindeer densities and carcass weights became 

prominent in the decision-making. The model, used and further developed in a number of 

biological studies (e.g. Ims & Kosmo 2001; Tveraa et al. 2007), presents an inverse 

relationship between the density of reindeer and weights of individual animals. A former 

director of the Reindeer Husbandry Administration (government official #3, interview June 

2013) expressed concern about the LMD basing their thinking and decisions on one-sided 

input from one particular academic group, and said that the same researchers were repeatedly 

invited by the LMD to lecture herders and staff at the Reindeer Husbandry Administration 

about carrying capacity. Furthermore, the method for estimating carrying capacity seems to 

have influenced the findings of the working group that had developed indicators for 

ecologically sustainable reindeer numbers: the indicators – such as carcass weight and the 

calving percentage of the reindeer – were classified as objective indicators, while traditional 

criteria of a healthy herd – such as the quality of the animal’s coats and the morphology of the 
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reindeer antlers and body – were classified as subjective and supplementary indicators 

(Landbruks- og matdepartementet 2008a).  

While ecological research in support of destocking and increasing animal weights was 

referred to by the politicians and government officials, research arguing that the relationship 

between reindeer numbers and vegetation changes is more complex than indicated by the 

regression models was neglected (Benjaminsen et al. in press). In addition, based on a much 

larger sample than Ims & Kosmo (2001), but carrying out the same type of regression 

analysis, Borgenvik (2014) found much lower correlations between carcass weights and 

densities of reindeer.  

Sara (2011, 142) argues that the current management regime is based on scientific 

theories that ‘cannot begin to appreciate the subtleties of age-old herding traditions, tailored 

over centuries to the topography of the land and the specific needs of particular herds 

throughout the seasons’. He is concerned that herders are requested to develop internal 

management plans using foreign language and foreign concepts, which are ‘poor substitutes 

for their own rich and complex understanding of their lands and herds’ (Sara 2011, 142). One 

regional official said that although the government officials in Oslo had the best intentions for 

reindeer husbandry, they were ignorant of the complex system made up by this type of 

livelihood and the herders’ customs (government official #4, interview March 2013). Another 

official from of the Reindeer Husbandry Administration argued that LMD bureaucrats did not 

have the necessary scientific insights to address the current challenges of the reindeer industry 

(government official #2, interview June 2013). The same official explained that the 

relationship between staff at the Ministry of Food and Agriculture and staff from the Reindeer 

Husbandry Administration was strained because the LMD would not listen to professional 

input from the Administration. 
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The actors had different interpretations of the causes and effects of high reindeer 

numbers in Finnmark. Interviewed government officials argued that the growing number of 

reindeer was a result of internal competition within the pastoral community, which led to a 

‘tragedy of the commons’. By contrast, interviewed herders provided a more complex 

explanation, and pointed to a combination of factors: state incentives encouraged calf 

production; herders slaughtered fewer reindeer than planned due to unreliable access to the 

market; the state’s introduction of common winter pastures undermined traditional land 

management and made it possible for some herders to move into new territory as well as to 

expand their herds; opposition to the state-driven destocking led to a higher reindeer 

population, competition between pastoral groups and more intensive use of land was 

increasing; and larger herds and more intensive grazing were used as a way to claim rights to 

land threatened by encroachment.  

Although most of the herders we interviewed were critical of the current production-

intensive management regime, some herders in Finnmark were in favour of the regime and 

argued that they had increased their income by reducing and restructuring their herds 

according to the state regulations for slaughter and meat production. By adapting to state 

regulations, these herders were also entitled to state subsidies. They were used as role models 

to give legitimacy to state regulation of reindeer numbers and their cases were presented in 

media and at conferences as success stories. 

Interviewed critical herders saw the ‘successful’ model herders as being co-opted by 

the LMD, and pointed to some commonalities that had made it easier for them to adapt to 

state-promoted reindeer husbandry: the model herders received relatively low destocking 

requirements because they had easy access to common grazing land for longer periods than 

most other herders), and they had their winter pastures close to roads and could therefore give 

their reindeer extra fodder during unfavourable grazing conditions when poor snow 
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conditions made it difficult for the reindeer to access lichen through the snow (conditions 

referred to as guohtun) (Eira et al. 2010a). Some interviewed herders were critical of how 

some of the model herders had appropriated parts of the commons for their own benefit, 

sometimes by fencing in and establishing their own private winter pastures. 

 

 

Sámi rights 

A common aspect of the dominant narrative and the counter-narrative is the focus on 

indigenous peoples’ rights. Both narratives refer to these rights as underlying values and 

reasons for the actors’ argumentation. However, the actors differed in their opinions on 

whether the decisions on reindeer numbers were in accordance with the Sámi reindeer 

herders’ rights.  

In a letter to Kautokeino Municipality, the LMD argued that, 

 

the authorities have an obligation under international law to ensure that future generations 

have the opportunity to practice reindeer herding and continue the Sámi reindeer herding 

culture. By protecting the pastures through animal reductions, and by demanding ecological 

sustainable reindeer husbandry practices, the process [of reducing reindeer numbers] will help 

fulfil the government’s obligations [to international law] (letter dated 17 June 2013).6 

 

Further, the LMD argued that the alternative – not interfering in the decision-making on 

reindeer numbers – would have violated international law and the rights of the next 

generations of Sámi herders (letter from the LMD to the Reindeer Husbandry Administration, 

dated 28 February 2011; for source, see note 4). 

NRL and the Sámi Parliament criticized the Norwegian Parliament for requesting 

decisions on herd reduction plans before the social and economic impacts of the reduction 
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plans had been assessed (Sámediggi 2012; NRL n.d.). They argued that a consequence of the 

reduction plans would be that a number of herders would no longer have enough animals to 

secure a viable income. Moreover, the enforced reduction of reindeer would affect a large 

portion of Finnmark’s reindeer herders in a negative way. NRL and the Sámi Parliament 

claimed that prior to the decisions the affected herding districts should have been consulted in 

accordance with the 2005 agreement on procedures for consultations between the state 

authorities and the Sámi Parliament (Kommunal- og regionaldepartementet & Sametinget 

2005). The herders argued that it was unfair and unreasonable to exclude them from any 

decision-making that had great impact on their livelihood. 

The minutes of the Reindeer Husbandry Board’s meeting held in February 2013 show 

that the majority of the board members were in agreement on the necessity to make decisions 

that affected individuals in order to preserve pastures for the benefit of the Sámi reindeer 

husbandry culture (letter from the Reindeer Husbandry Administration to a reindeer herder, 

dated 27 February 2013).7  

A leading government official claimed that the decision-making process had ‘one 

hundred per cent legitimacy’ (NRK Sápmi 2013) as the decisions were in accordance with the 

Reindeer Husbandry Act, which had been passed by the Norwegian Parliament after 

consultation with the herders. The majority of members of the Reindeer Husbandry Board 

legitimized their decision on reindeer reductions by stating that the rules on pasture use had 

been developed through a bottom-up approach and that it was the districts’ responsibility to 

ensure that their management plans addressed the needs of the districts and individual herders, 

and fulfilled the requirements of the law. However, one official at the Reindeer Husbandry 

Administration agreed with the herders who claimed that the herding districts should have 

been consulted about reindeer reductions (government official #2, interview June 2013). He 

was concerned that the decisions might have been in conflict with the law, since on 
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instructions from the LMD in Oslo the Administration had not consulted herders prior to the 

decisions on the reduction plans.8 

 

 

Actor rationality 

Both the dominant narrative and the counter-narrative provide explanations for the behaviour 

and rationality of government officials and herders in Finnmark. The dominant narrative 

describes the herders as irrational actors who do not understand or act according to their own 

good and thus, the government has had to take certain measures to save indigenous 

livelihoods. By contrast, the counter-narrative portrays herders as the victims of an arrogant 

and controlling state. 

Lars Peder Brekk, former Minister of Food and Agriculture, described the herders in 

Finnmark as opportunistic because they let their herds grow at the expense of animal welfare, 

biodiversity, and their fellow herders (interview August 2012). Eilif Aslaksen, a journalist at 

the Norwegian Broadcasting Corporation (NRK) reflected the dominant narrative when 

writing: ‘The collapse of reindeer husbandry reflects failed self-management’ (NRK Sápmi 

2010). The journalist claimed that ‘cynicism and greed have developed freely on the tundra 

[while] Norwegian governments have failed to intervene to prevent the disaster’. Trygve 

Slagsvold Vedum (former Minister of Food and Agriculture), commented on the herders’ 

rationality as follows: ‘What is beneficial for the collective community, can be seen as 

demanding for individuals’ (Finnmark Dagblad 2012). He claimed that instead of reducing 

the size of their herds, herders pointed to the need to reduce numbers in neighbouring herding 

districts, and he urged herders instead to ‘behave like businesses and ensure sustainable 

operations’ (Nationen 2012). As a response to herders’ perceived irrational behaviour, the 

Government made it a political goal to ‘develop reindeer husbandry as a rational market-
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oriented industry that will be sustainable in the long term’ (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 

2014b, 13).  

However, the interviewed herders claimed that the state had an arrogant attitude to 

Sámi traditions. They argued that the state-enforced destocking efforts were counter-

productive for reducing herd sizes, as the decision-making only created mistrust and 

opposition amongst the herders towards the authorities. According to one herder, the 

decision-making became unpredictable and non-transparent (herder #8, interview June 2013). 

Another herder even claimed that the LMD changed the ‘rules of the game just to harm the 

reindeer industry’ (herder #6, interview June 2013). Many of the herders interviewed, 

supported by interviewed members of the Sámi Parliament as well as staff at the national and 

regional Reindeer Husbandry Administration, said that it seemed as if the LMD had set a 

politically acceptable number of reindeer for Finnmark before the herding districts were 

tasked with identifying the maximum sustainable numbers of reindeer. One of the 

Administration’s officials said it seemed as though it was more important for the LMD to 

achieve a specific target than to facilitate a bottom-up decision-making process as first agreed 

(government official #2, interview June 2013). The interviewed herders speculated that the 

LMD’s motivation was to wipe out reindeer husbandry in order to facilitate the exploitation 

of natural resources (e.g. minerals) of the high north. 

We have shown a clear contrast between how the main actors described their own 

rationality and the rationality of the other actor group: government officials as responsible 

rescuers as opposed to arrogant and controlling; and herders as irrational and backward as 

opposed to powerless victims. Thus, the two narratives on reindeer management present the 

archetypes of heroes, villains, and victims, archetypes that recur in global environmental 

discourses (Adger et al. 2001). The dominant narrative portrays the herders as villains and the 

state as hero, while the counter-narrative describes the state as the villain and the herders as 
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victims. However, our findings also show that there were discrepancies within the actor 

groups. State officials interpreted the West Finnmark herders’ behaviour differently 

depending on where they worked within the management system, whether in the Reindeer 

Husbandry Administration in West Finnmark, the central Administration in Alta in Finnmark, 

or he LMD headquarters in Oslo. The lower down in the hierarchy – and the geographically 

closer to the reindeer herders – the more nuanced were the state officials’ views of reindeer 

herders’ rationality. Although all interviewed state officials agreed to a certain extent that 

there is a need for destocking, staff at the regional Reindeer Husbandry Administration also 

sympathized with the claim that state’s decision-making was unpredictable and non-

transparent, thus making it challenging for the herders to influence this decision-making. 

Some government officials at the Reindeer Administration in Finnmark were even very 

critical of how the LMD in Oslo had interfered in the processes of setting reindeer numbers 

and making reduction plans (government officials #2, #3, and #5, respective interviews June 

2013, August 2013, and January 2014).  

 

 

Seeing like the state or like pastoralists 

The state and reindeer herders have contradicting narratives on the governance of reindeer 

pastoralism, but why is the LMD’s perspective well known and recognized amongst the 

general public, in contrast to the herders’ alternative perspective? In the following, we 

examine how the dominant narrative marginalizes the counter-narrative. 

The dominant narrative – that there are too many reindeer and the herders lack ability 

to take responsibility – is a presentation that seems to resonate well with the general public. In 

recent decades, the media has presented stories about too many reindeer, which cause 

desertification, lead to reindeer grazing on farmers’ crops and in private gardens, block 
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industrial development, and result in increased conflicts with the conservation of protected 

predators. In 2009, the LMD even promoted destocking reindeer herds as a measure to cut 

greenhouse gases (St.meld nr. 39 (2008–2009)). The LMD stated that methane emissions 

from domesticated reindeer in Norway were equivalent to 53,000 tonnes of CO2 per year and 

argued that destocking the herds by 30,000 animals would reduce the national emissions of 

greenhouse gases by c.10,000 tonnes of CO2 equivalents per year (St.meld nr. 39 (2008–

2009)). 

Thus, ‘too many reindeer’ has been presented as a problem for Norwegian society in 

many different ways: too many reindeer threaten biodiversity, hamper animal welfare, block 

economic development, contribute to global warming, and claim too much space. Since most 

Norwegians might internalize one or several of these problems as a concern, the narrative 

might resonate with many different interest groups. The dominant narrative therefore unites 

‘communities that might otherwise seem disparate’ (Robbins 2012, 140), such as 

environmentalists and mining companies.  

The Norwegian state’s narrative on reindeer husbandry is neither new nor original. 

There are long historical continuities in how states tend to see pastoralism. For example, since 

colonialism, African states have perceived pastoral systems as unproductive (regarded as not 

contributing to national economies), unorganized (as pastoralists are considered to roam 

around), and environmentally destructive (because they are seen as causes of overgrazing and 

desertification) (Pedersen & Benjaminsen 2008; Benjaminsen et al. 2009). The Norwegian 

state’s narrative on ‘too many reindeer’ falls into a global neo-Malthusian discourse on land 

degradation and desertification (Adger et al. 2001).  

The Norwegian state management of reindeer husbandry is vested in the Ministry of 

Food and Agriculture (LMD), and government officials use agricultural theories to describe 

and measure sustainable reindeer husbandry, with a focus on standardizing the herd structure. 
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However, in traditional Sámi reindeer husbandry attention is paid to structuring a herd to fit 

the landscape and available pastures, and finding the right mix of animals of different sex and 

ages to utilize the various pastures and ease migration (Oskal 2000; Paine 2004). By defining 

and modelling sustainable reindeer husbandry in terms of ‘modern’ agriculture, the state has 

redefined what reindeer husbandry ought to be (Paine 1996). As herders in Finnmark have to 

a lesser degree than other herders adapted to the state definition of ‘proper’ reindeer 

husbandry, they are regarded as less successful and less capable. Their characterization as 

‘irrational’ herders is used to legitimize the need for a controlling state. 

Debates about rational herding and sustainable reindeer husbandry take place also in 

Sweden and Finland. Heikkilä (2006, 79–80) argues that the approach to nature as a resource 

and the integration of ‘the idea of production rationality into environmental management 

practices’ was emphasized in both Finland and Norway during the 1990s. Based on a study of 

pasture management in Sweden, Beach (2004) argues that the focus on the ‘sustainable 

development’ of reindeer husbandry legitimized state control and management of the Sámi 

traditional livelihood. He presents the term ‘eco-colonialism’ to describe the practice of using 

ecological arguments to increase regulation of the Sámi herders. With a focus on Finland, 

Heikkinen et al. (2007) argue that reindeer husbandry management that emphasizes ecological 

carrying capacity and economic rationalization erodes the sociocultural sustainability of 

traditional Sámi reindeer husbandry.  

In his book Seeing Like a State, Scott sets out ‘to understand why the state has always 

seemed to be the enemy of “people who move around”’ (Scott 1998, 1). He argues that states 

tend to see mobile people as threats to classic state functions such as taxation, conscription, 

and the prevention of conflict or rebellion. This leads states to attempt to make complex land 

and resource use ‘legible’ and ‘simplified’. Hence, simplification and standardization of 

pastoral landscapes and practices form part of the state’s attempts at making society ‘legible’. 
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Following up on this idea, Li (2007) says that in the art of governing, the state needs to 

establish a serious problem that its policy will solve. In the case of pastoralism, this will often 

take the form of ‘overgrazing’, economic ‘inefficiency’, or increased land-use conflicts. 

Thereafter, the state may claim that this problem can only be solved through scientific and 

technical means. Li (2007) calls these two steps ‘problematization’ and ‘rendering technical’, 

and science plays a key role in both steps. According to Berkes (2008), the positivist-

reductionist approach in Western science has dominated contemporary resource management 

and has synthesized knowledge about the world into ‘value-free’ generalizations independent 

of context, space, and time. Heikkinen et al. (2007) argue that there is a tendency within 

governance of reindeer pastoralism to detach the economic and ecological variables from 

broader political, economic, and ecological contexts, and not to recognize the interplay 

between the variables and the politics of power and knowledge. Hence, problems that are 

rendered technical by government policy and practice are simultaneously rendered non-

political.  

In the case of Sámi reindeer pastoralism in Norway, the simplification, 

standardization, and ‘rendering technical’ take place when government officials both define 

the challenges of reindeer husbandry in Finnmark and when they define the solutions to these 

challenges. As we have shown, the stated political objective is to ensure sustainable reindeer 

husbandry (St.meld nr. 28 (1991–1992)) and to ‘develop reindeer husbandry as a rational 

market-oriented industry’ (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 2014b, 13). Further, the LMD 

has identified ‘too many reindeer’ as the main threat to achieving this objective in Finnmark. 

According to government officials, solving the problem of too many reindeer will also solve 

related concerns such as overgrazing, animal welfare, economic inefficiency, and land-use 

conflicts.  

The state and its experts argue and act as though they ‘know what pastoral utility and 
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profitability should be (and they have a unitary view of it)’ (Paine 1992, 13; emphasis and 

parenthesis in the original text). Norwegian values and premises have therefore become 

models for Sámi pastoralism (Paine 2004), and as Heikkilä (2006, 83) observed in Finland, 

‘herders are not regarded as experts in their own field’. Herders who wish to make an 

effective and valid case have to adapt their argumentation and rational to the authorities’ view 

of reality (Heikkilä 2006). In this reality one particular technical approach is used to assess 

whether or not reindeer herds are adjusted to the grazing land. First, the average carcass 

weights are examined, and if the weights are below a desired level, the conclusion is drawn 

that the herd is beyond carrying capacity. Next, a regression model based on the idea of 

density-dependent carcass weights is used to identify the ‘proper’ herd size for a herding 

district. The terminology used by government officials to describe sustainable reindeer 

numbers further reflects the state’s simplified view of reindeer husbandry, as the carcass 

weights are divided into three ‘traffic light’ categories: green, yellow, and red (Reindriftsnytt 

2012). Weights that give a green light indicate sustainability, while yellow blinking lights and 

red lights indicates too many reindeer (government official #8, interview August 2012).  

The standardization of the herd structure and setting maximum reindeer numbers are 

tools designed to simplify the reindeer sector and to render it technical and thereby legible to 

bureaucrats in the LMD and other government offices. However, governance of reindeer 

pastoralism based on these simplifications leaves little room for the herders’ complex situated 

and local knowledge of reindeer and pasture management, and may even undermine it. 

Traditional elements of Sámi reindeer management, such as diversity, flexibility, and 

mobility, build adaptive capacity to deal with habitat fragmentation, pasture degradation, and 

climate change (Mathiesen et al. 2013). The herders’ knowledge includes how to use pastures 

and alter migration patterns to adapt to weather conditions or insect plagues, and the size and 

composition of the herd depends on the location, quality, and quantity of available pastures 
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(Paine 1996). The consequence of undermining traditional knowledge is a weakening of the 

adaptive capacity in reindeer herding communities (Mathiesen et al. 2013). 

Robbins (2006) argues that whether a knowledge system is recognized as legitimate 

depends on the economic and discursive power of the knowledge promoters. In his study of 

environmental knowledge and power in the greater Northern Yellowstone region, he found 

that the least economically powerful actors (the local hunters) were marginalized in 

discussions on resource management; the local hunters’ knowledge was dismissed as 

‘barstool biology’. Labelling hunters as ignorant created antipathy for their arguments in the 

discussion on wildlife conservation and legitimized management practices, which in turn 

reduced the local hunters’ traditional access to hunting and nature (Robbins 2006). In a case 

study of politics, administration, and planning in the Danish town of Aalborg, Flyvbjerg 

(1998, 117) explains that it ‘is not whether one or the other interpretation is “correct” or 

“true” but which party can put the greatest power behind its interpretation’. He argues that 

‘power produces knowledge, knowledge produces power’ (Flyvbjerg 2004, 293). Robbins 

(2012) too argues that the persistence of particular narratives is a cause and consequence of 

their power in decision-making policy management. In Norway, the narrative about too many 

reindeer has been presented repeatedly for several decades (NTB 1978; 1992; 1999a; NRK 

Sápmi 2015; Aftenposten 2011a; NRK 2012; Nationen 2014).  

In the competing efforts of the state and the herders to define ‘proper’ reindeer 

husbandry, the actors have unequal access to information and decision-making as well as 

uneven access to arenas for promoting their stories, which skews the power relation between 

them (Dryzek 2005). The dominant narrative is often reflected in the media, online 

discussions, and in debates in the Norwegian Parliament, whereas the counter-narrative is 

rarely presented in Norwegian public debates. Norwegian society at large has varying 

perceptions of the credibility of the respective actors. While government officials are regarded 
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as objective, Sámi herders are seen as subjective and acting to maximize their own gain. This 

perception is reinforced by the media’s rather one-sided presentations of reindeer herders who 

exploit the state’s weakness and naivety regarding the reindeer industry (NRK Sápmi 2010; 

2011; 2012; Altaposten 2011; 2012a; 2012b). At the same time, the LMD and the Reindeer 

Husbandry Administration promote herders that have ‘properly’ adapted to the governance 

regime and present these as success stories (Altaposten 2013; Reindriftsnytt 2013; Finnmark 

Dagblad 2014).  

In August 2013, the LMD and NRL co-hosted a conference with the stated purpose of 

enabling the actors to create a better dialogue between herders and government on challenges 

to reindeer husbandry. However, while a number of the keynote speakers, including a 

researcher and a herder from West Finnmark, gave presentations supporting the dominant 

narrative, none of the presentations represented the herders’ counter-narrative. The only 

opportunity to put forward alternative perspectives was through brief comments or questions 

from the audience. Consequently, the dominant narrative was not challenged and a balanced 

dialogue between the actors did not occur. 

 

 

Conclusions 

Two contrasting perspectives on self-management in the governance of reindeer pastoralism 

have been examined: a dominant policy narrative claiming that pastoralists enjoy considerable 

decision-making power and explains growing reindeer numbers by a ‘tragedy of the 

commons’ and the pastoralists’ counter-narrative arguing that there are obstacles to 

participation in practice and that the state-driven decision-making processes lack transparency 

and predictability. Our findings show that both the LMD and herders used arguments of 

participation, knowledge, Sámi rights, and actor rationality to provide legitimacy for their 
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own narratives. 

The dominant narrative is recognizable as it is part of a global environmental 

discourse on land degradation and desertification caused by overstocking of pastoral land 

(Adger et al. 2001). By attributing full responsibility for overstocking and land degradation to 

the herders, the dominant narrative establishes herders as villains driven by the aim to 

maximize their own gain. The story of the irrational pastoralist creates antipathy for the 

herders and serves to legitimize the need for a responsive and controlling state.  

Furthermore, the narrative of ‘too many reindeer’ is usually modified to fit different 

audiences, but is often portrayed as a threat to society at large: overstocking is said to threaten 

biodiversity, hamper animal welfare, threaten economic development, and contribute to 

global warming. Thus, groups with different and sometimes conflicting agendas use the 

dominant narrative and promote destocking to advocate their interests. 

We have shown that the LMD defines the solutions to the problem of too many 

reindeer by simplifying and rendering Sámi reindeer husbandry technical: informed by certain 

scientific contributions, vegetation changes and animal weights are used to guide decision-

making. Destocking is presented as the solution to ensure a ‘proper’ reindeer industry that is 

ecologically sustainable and economically rational. The interplay between the economic and 

ecological variables and the politics of power and knowledge is not recognized (Heikkinen et 

al. 2007). The dominant narrative presents a view of herders that do not accept government 

instructions concerning reindeer husbandry as being ignorant, and stories of irrational herders 

have become more powerful than stories of victimized herders presented in the counter-

narrative. 

The consistency in the way the dominant narrative is told is both a cause and 

consequence of the authority this narrative is given (Robbins 2012). While the herders’ 

counter-narrative is rarely reflected in public, we find the LMD’s narrative presented 
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regularly in governmental documents, media presentations, and in political debates in the 

Norwegian Parliament. Also, the media plays a role in legitimizing the LMD’s perspectives 

by rather one-sided presentation of the dominant narrative. One consequence is that in 

Norwegian public debates it has become a truth that Sámi pastoralists are overstocking and 

degrading the land to maximize their own benefits. However, while the dominant narrative is 

recognized by the general public, the herders’ counter-narrative remains marginalized. 

 

 

Notes 

1 The Norwegian Reindeer Husbandry Administration, organized as part of the LMD, 

functions as secretariat for the Reindeer Husbandry Board. In July 2014 the Reindeer 

Husbandry Administration was merged with the Norwegian Agricultural Authority (Statens 

landbruksforvaltning) and became the Norwegian Agriculture Agency 

(Landbruksdirektoratet) (Landbruks- og matdepartementet 2014a).  

2 The overall objective of the strategy ‘is to create sustainable growth and development in the 

High North’ (Norwegian Ministry of Foreign Affairs 2006, 7). In the follow-up to this 

strategy there has been a strong focus on facilitating a ‘new industrial age in the High North’ 

(Norwegian Ministry of Foreign Affairs 2011, 15). 

3 An epistemological approach in qualitative studies that provides a strategy for developing 

theories grounded in empirical knowledge and induction (Svarstad 2010). 

4 A copy of the letter was requested from the archives of the LMD and the Reindeer 

Husbandry Administration and was received in March 2014. 

5 Copy received in October 2013 of letter dated 15 April 2012 from the herders’ lawyer to the 

Reindeer Husbandry Administration. 

6 A copy of the letter dated 18 June 2013 was provided by a member of Kautokeino Municipal 
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Council. 

7 A copy of the letter dated was provided by the recipient in October 2013. 

8 Based on instructions and guidance from the LMD, the Reindeer Husbandry Administration 

developed guidelines on how to interpret the 2007 Act and procedures for issuing orders for 

reindeer number reductions (Reindriftsstyret, ‘Grunnlagsdokument – Reindriftsloven §60 – 

Vedtak om pålegg om forholdsmessig reduksjon. 63/12. Møtedato: 6. desember 2012’; copy 

of the document provided by the Reindeer Husbandry Administration from the archives of the 

LMD and the Administration). The guidelines were adopted by the Reindeer Husbandry 

Board. 
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